
11-9055

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

PROPOSAL Six month contract for Janitorial Supplies
FOR: Disinfectants, Cleaners & Paper Supplies

TIME & October 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 1, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Category I DISINFECTANTS AND CLEANERS  

 NEUTRAL ALL-PURPOSE FLOOR CLEANER Price per case 45.40 25.60 19.59 28.43

(17444) Total 544.80 307.20 235.08 341.16

Description:  Non-Dulling and rinse free, cirtrus Size 1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon

Brand:  Stride Brand Compare Johnson AS NCL Image

Size:  1 gal containers (4 per case) Product Code F2166022 JW-3904 Spec 2012126

Product Code: JW-3904 Manufacturer Franklin Johnson Johnson Diversey NCL

Manufacturer:  Johnson Qty per case 4 4 4 4

Estimated Qty:  12 cans/6 mo.

COMPLETE FLOOR FINISH (17443) Price/Envirobox 119.26 62.71 52.92 61.00

METAL INTERLOCK Total 715.56 376.26 317.52 366.00

Size:  5 gallon Envirobox Size 5 gallons 5 gallons 5 gallons 5 gallons

Product Code: 4651 Brand Megastar Extreme Complete Floor Finish AS Display

Manufacturer:  Johnson Product Code F330126 JW-5104773 Spec 201562

Estimated Qty:  6 Enviro Boxes/ 6 mo. Manufacturer Franklin Johnson Diversey Brulin

 Qty per box 5 gal. bucket 1-5 gal box 1 2/2.5 gal

FOAMING DISINFECTANT CLEANER (10479) Price per case 39.09 27.28 39.27 35.20

MISTY FOAM (12/CASE) Total 1,250.88 872.96 1,256.64 1,126.40

Product Code: APA250 Brand Misty Misty AS Misty

Manufacturer:  AMREP Product Code APA250 APA250 Spec AMR A250-20

Estimated Qty = (32 case/6 mo.) Manufacturer Amrep Amrep AMREP AMREP

ANY SUBSTITUTE MUST BE PREAPPROVED Qty per Case 12 12 12 12

CLEANER CARPET (10294) Price per case 106.25 33.45 31.73 37.81

Size:  One gallon Total 425.00 133.80 126.92 151.24

Case 4 gallons Size 1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon

Brand: Plus 5 Brand Spartan Plus 5 Plus 5 As Spec Husky

Product Code No: SP 3005 4 Product Code SP30054 SP3005-04 5 201898

Manufacturer:  Spartin Chemical Manufacturer Spartan Spartan Spartan Canberra

Estimated Qty:  4 cases/6 mo. Qty per case 4 4 4 4

ANY SUBSTITUTE MUST BE PREAPPROVED

DEODORANT CARPET (33352) Price per case 106.25 69.81 68.13 25.80

Size: One Gallon Total 3,187.50 2,094.30 2,043.90 774.00

Case: 4 gallons Size 32 oz. 1 gallon gallon 1 gallon

Brand: Airlift Tropical Brand Misty Secure Amlift Tropical AS BLITZIT

Product Code No.: SP3067 Product Code AMR-R930-12 SP-3067 Spec 2BZ203G

Manufacturer: Spartin Chemical Manufacturer  Spartan Spartan Safeway

Estimated Qty = 30 case/6 mo. Qty per case 12 4 gal/cs 4 4

ANY SUBSTITUTE MUST BE PREAPPROVED

LIQUID BOWL CLEANER (10471) Price per case 30.94 18.69 17.81 24.60

Description:  Non-Acid Disinfectant Total 495.04 299.04 284.96 393.60

Brand: NABC Bathroom Cleaner Size  1 qt. qt. 32 oz (Qt)

Manufacturer: Spartan SP7116 Brand  NABC Bathroom Cln. AS Bathroom Plus

Size: 1 quart (12/case) Part No.   SP-7116 Spec 201199

Est. Qty = (16 cases/6 mo) Manufacturer  Spartan Spartan NCL

Qty per case  12 qts/cs 12 12

LIQUID BOWL CLEANER (10470) Price per Case 48.95 17.16 16.37 23.18

Description:  Acid Disinfectant Total 1,272.70 446.16 425.62 602.68

Brand: M95 Mild Acid Cleaner Size  1 qt. qt. 32 oz (Qt)

Size: 1 quart (12/case) Brand  M95 Mild Acid Cln. AS Husky 300

Manufacturer: Spartan SP7115 Part No.  SP-7115 Spec 201943

Est Qty = (26 cases/6 mo) Manufacturer Spartan Spartan Canberra

 Qty per case  12 qts./cs 12 12
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11-9055

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)
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CLEANER, HAND (10487) Price per case 33.15 43.24 32.75 41.25

Description: Natural Orange Smooth Total 66.30 86.48 65.50 82.50

Size: 14 oz Brand  Natural Orange AJ GoJo

Part No.: YGJ0961-12 per case Size  14 oz. Spec 14 oz.

Manufacturer: GOJO Part No.  YGJ-0961-12 GoJo961 0961-12

Est Qty = (2 cases/6 mo.) Qty per case  12/14 oz/cs 12 12

SOAP, HAND, solid (10779) Price per case 47.88 50.79 47.28 46.25

Size:  2 1/2 oz Total 47.88 50.79 47.28 46.25

Brand:  Dial Size  2.5 oz Bar AJ 2.5 oz

Part No. Dia 00197 Brand  Dial Spec Dial

Qty per case 200 per case Part No.  DIA00197 00197 DIA 00197

Est Qty = 1 case/6 mo. Qty per case  200/cs 200 200

SOAP, HAND, PINK & KLEAN (10485) Price per case 31.73 28.22 23.55 23.62

Size: 800 ML Total 126.92 112.88 94.20 94.48

Brand: GoJo Size  800 ML 800 ml 800 ml

Part No. 912812 Brand   GoJo Boardwalk KUTOL

Qty per case: 12 per case Part No.  GJ-9128-12 BWK 8100 5665

Est Qty = (4 cases/6 mo.) Qty per case  12/800 mls/cs 12 12

CLEANER, HAND WITH PUMICE (10484) Price per case 37.06 45.52 36.65 42.25

Size:  14 oz  (12 bottles per case) Total 333.54 409.68 329.85 380.25

Scent:  Orange Size  14 oz. AS 14 oz 

Brand:  GoJo Color  Orange Spec Orange

Part No. 0957-12 Brand  GoJo GoJo GoJo

Estimated Qty = 9 cases/6 mo. Part No.  EJ-0957-12 0957-12 0957-08

SOAP DISPENSER AUTOFOAM (31516) Price per each 53.95 44.40 49.48 55.40

Manufacturer:  Technical Concepts Total 53.95 44.40 49.48 55.40

Product Code: TC 750139 Brand  TC Auto Foam Disp. AS T Concepts

Estimated Qty = (1/6 mo.) Part No.  TC-75013 Spec TC 750139

No Substitutes  

Soap Autofoam Refills (31517) Price per Case 72.46 64.50 64.57 65.32

Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Total 4,927.28 4,386.00 4,390.76 4,441.76

Product Code: TC 750115 Brand  TC-Autofoam Soap TC T Concepts

4 per case Part No.  TC-750112 TC 750112 TC 750112

Estimated Qty = (68 cases/6 mo.)

No Substitutes  

Waterless Hand Cleaning (10488) Price per case 46.08 40.98 45.86 41.60

Size 4.25 oz Total 6,865.92 6,106.02 6,833.14 6,198.40

Brand Purell Size  4.25 oz 4.25 oz 4.25

Part No. 965124 Brand  Purrell AJ Purrell

Qty per case 24 bottles Part No.  EJ-9651-24 Spec 9651-24

Est. Qty (149 cases/6 mo.) Qty/case  24 btls/cs 24 24

No Substitutes  

Waterless Hand Cleaning (33154) Price/case 59.05 52.54 58.33 62.60

Size 12 oz with pump Total 118.10 105.08 116.66 125.20

Brand Purell Size  12 oz. As Spec 12 oz.

Part No. J965912 Brand  Purrell Purrell Purrell

Qty per case 12 bottles Part No.  GJ-9659-12 965912 GOJ 3659-12

Est. Qty (2 cases/6 mo.) Qty/case  12 blts./cs 12 12

Waterless Hand Cleaning Foam (33749) Price/case 61.84 55.02 59.72 55.17

Size 1200 ML Total 1,236.80 1,100.40 1,194.40 1,103.40

Brand Purell Size  1200 ml 1200 ml 1200 ml

Part No. J5392-02 Brand  Purrell As Spec Purrell

Qty per case: Two Part No.  GJ-5392-02 5392 GOJ 5392-02

Est. Qty (20 cases/6 mo.) Qty/case  2/cs 2 2
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Soap, detergent granular laundry (16034) Price per case 116.25 90.60 76.24 83.15

Size 32 oz Total 2,557.50 1,993.20 1,677.28 1,829.30

Brand: Tide Size  20 oz. 21 oz. 20 oz

Part No. PGC 30804 Brand  Tide Tide w/bleach Tide 

Manufacturer: Procter & Gamble Part No.  PGC-27782 27810 PGC 27782

Qty/case 15 ea. Manufacturer  Proctor & Gamble Proctor & Gamble Proctor & Gamble

Estimated Qty = (22 cases/6 mo.) Qty per case  15/20 oz. 15 15

Soap, Dish detergent (16035) Price per case 32.54 49.01 30.25 30.95

Size 12.6 oz Total 585.72 882.18 544.50 557.10

Brand: Ivory Szie  24 oz. 24 oz. 24 oz.

Part No. PGC0620 Brand  Ivory AS Ivory

Manufacturer: Procter & Gamble Part No.  PG-25574 Spec PGC 25574

Qty per case 10 Manufacturer  Proctor & Gamble Proctor & Gamble Proctor & Gamble

Estimated Qty = 18 cases/6 mo. Qty per case  10 bxs/cs 10 10

No Substitutes  

Cleaner, stainless steel (10495) Price per case 60.89 34.62 56.01 55.12

Size: 15 oz spray (12 per case) Total 304.45 173.10 280.05 275.60

Misty AP A141 Size  15 oz. AS 15 oz

Est. Qty (5 cases/6 mo.) Brand  Misty AP-A141 Spec Misty

ANY SUBSTITUTE MUST BE PREAPPROVED Qty per case  12/cs 12 AMR A141-20

Cleaner, Glass (10482) Price per gallon 13.75 3.31 3.24 6.99

Size 1 gallon Total 990.00 238.32 233.28 503.28

Part No. A2 9643 AKB 4 Size  1 gal. gal gal

Color: Blue Part No.  AR-9643 190 202216

Est. Qty: 72 gal/6 mo.

Bleach, Liquid (9687) Price per case 12.00 10.65 9.99 11.25

Size 96 oz 6% (6 per case) Total 336.00 298.20 279.72 315.00

Estimated Qty = 28 cases/6 mo. Size 1 gallon 96 oz. 96 oz. 96 oz.

 Qty/case 6 6/96 oz/cs 6 6

Spray Trigger (16136) Price per each 0.54 0.70 0.64 0.49

Size: 9 inch Total 51.30 66.50 60.80 46.55

Part No. T0 110504 Size 8" 9" 9" 9"

Estimated Qty = (95/6 mo.)

Spray Bottle (9829) Price per each 2.94 0.50 0.48 0.40

Size: 24 oz Size 176.40 30.00 28.80 24.00

Part No. TO 120119 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz

Estimated Qty = (60 ea/6 mo.)  

Industrial Dusting Cloths (33741) Price per each 25.48 52.05 41.17 77.00

Size: 17x24 inches (yellow) Total 50.96 104.10 82.34 154.00

4 packs per case (50 per pk) Size 12.5 x 13 17x24 AS 17x24

Brand: Brawny Qty per case 4/50 4 pks/50/pk Spec 200 4/50

Mfg. Georgia-Pacific Brand Wypall Brawny 29616 Brawny

Estimated Qty = (2 cases/ 6 mo.) Mfg. Name Kimberley Clark Georgia-Pacific Georgia-Pacific Kimberley Clark

Heavy Duty Towel Wipes (16858) Price per each 32.86 22.90 24.22 27.50

Size: 12 1/2 x 13 inch Total 525.76 366.40 387.52 440.00

4 packs per case (50 per pk) Size 7x8 12 1/2 x 3" As Spec 12.5x13

Brand:  Wypall x 80 Wipers Qty per case 6/80 ct. 4 pks/50 ea. 200 4/50

Mfg: Kimberly-Clark Brand Lysol Wypall x 80 wipes Wypall Wuypall x 80

Estimated Qty = (16 cases/6 mo.) Mfg. Name Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark
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Wipe Disinfectant Sheets (33306) Price per each 31.24 27.50 44.99 27.75  

Size: 75 per carton Total 11,246.40 9,900.00 16,196.40 9,990.00  

Qty: 6 cartons per case Size  75/ctn. 75/ctn. 75/ctn.  

Brand: Clorax Fresh Scent 15949 Qty per case  6 ctns/cs 12 6  

Mfg. Clorax Brand  Clorax Fresh Scent Wipes plus fresh Clorox Fresh Scent  

 Estimated Qty = (360 cases/6 mo.) Mfg. Name  Clorax  Progressive Clorox   

CATEGORY I:  DISINFECTANTS AND CLEANERS *

TOTAL 38,492.66 30,983.45 37,582.60 30,417.55  

Category II PAPER PRODUCTS

COVER, TOILET SEAT, 1/2 FOLD (31238) Price per case 28.19 49.04 39.90  46.25

Part No.: HG5000 Total 56.38 98.08 79.80 NO BID 92.50

Brand: Hospital Specialty Part No. HG-5000  HG-5000  891-098

Qty per case: 5000 Brand Hospital Specialty  Hospital Specialty  HS

Estimated Qty = 2 cases/6 mo. Qty per case 5000  5000  5000

TOILET PAPER (14592) Price per case 34.02 60.95 34.48  38.13

2 Ply 500 sheets per roll 4 1/2" x 3.75 IN TOTAL 4,932.90 8,837.75 4,999.60 NO BID 5,528.85

Brand:  Tork Universal Part No. 2 ply 500 sh/rl 6150 TM-1616S  TM16165

Manufacturer:  SCA Brand Tork Universal Boardwalk Tork Universal  Tork

Manufacturer Code Number:  TM1616S Manufacturer SCA Boardwalk SCA  SCA

Rolls per case:  96 Mfr. Code Number TM-16165 BWK 6150 TM-1616S  TM16163

Sheet Size:  4 1/2" x 3.75 Rolls per case 96.00 96 96  96

Sheets per roll:  500 Sheet Size 4.0" x 3.75" 4.5" x 3.75" 4.5" x 3.75"  4.5" x 3.75"

Case Weight:  37.4 lb Sheets per roll 500 500 500  500

Estimated Qty:  145 cases/6 mo. Case weight 33.07 lb 35 lbs. 37.4 lbs.  37.4 lbs.

TOILET PAPER (14591) Price per case 23.51 23.40 23.59  26.00

2 ply 1000 ft per roll 8 8/10 inch 3 1/3" wide Total 2,938.75 2,925.00 2,948.75 NO BID 3,250.00

Brand : Tork Universal Part No. 2 ply 1000/roll 3BR20306 KC-07805  TJ 0922A

Manufacturer: SCA Brand Tork Universal Sanilux Scott Jilt Jr.  Tork

Manufacturer Code Number: SC TJ0922A Manufacturer SCA Beroky Kimberley Clark  SCA

Rolls per case:  12 Mfr. Code Number TJ0922A 20306 KC-07805  SC TJ0922A

Estimated Qty = 125 cases/6 mo. Rolls per case 12 12 12  12

TOILET PAPER (36299) Price per case 35.96 66.10 36.15  40.10

Jumbo Roll Core Less Total 2,804.88 5,155.80 2,819.70 NO BID 3,127.80

3.78 inches x 1150 Part No. Jumbo Coreless 2 ply KCC 07006 KC-07006  07006

Brand:  Kimberly Clark Brand Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

Manufacturer Code Number:  KCC 07006 Mfr. Code Number 7006 KCC07006 KC-07006  07006

Rolls per case: 12 Rolls per case 12 12 12  12

Estimated Qty (78 cases/6 mo.)

No Substitutes

MULTIFOLD TOWELS (16856) Price per case 17.76 32.23 17.98  20.10

Manufacturer Code: SC MB540A Total 888.00 1,611.50 899.00 NO BID 1,005.00

Color: Bleached White Mfr. Code Number MB54A 46974 SC-MB540A  SC-MB540A

Towerl Size: 9 1/2 x 9 1/8 Color Bleach White Bleach White Bleach White  White

Towersl per pack: 250 Towels Towel Size 9 1/2 x 9 1/8 9.25 x 9.50 9 1/2 x 9 1/8  9 1/2 x 9 1/8

Packs per case: 16 packs Towels per pack 250 250 250  250

Manufacturer Name: SCA Packs per case 16 16 16  16

Estimated Qty = 50 cases/6 mo. Mfr. Name SCA Marathon SCA  SCA
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Roll Towels Scott (31427) Price per case 63.62 143.60 64.00  61.30

Manufacturer Code: KC 01000 Total 8,779.56 19,816.80 8,832.00 NO BID 8,459.40

Color: White Mfr. Code Number 01000  KC-01000  KC-01000

Towel Size: 8" x 100 ft Color White  White  White

Rolls per case: 12 Towel Size 8" x 1000'  8" x 1000 ft.   8" x 1000 ft.

Manufacturer Name: Kimberly Clark Rolls per case 12  12  12

Est. Qty = 138 case/6 mo. Mfg. Name Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

No Substitutes

Towel Hand Popup (16857) Price per case 50.04 87.85 49.75  55.26

Towel Size: 9.1 in x 16.8 in Total 200.16 351.40 199.00 NO BID 221.04

Brand: Kimtowel Size 9.1" x 16.8" 9 x 10.5" 9.1" x 16.8"  9.1" x 16.8"

Product Code: KC 47044 Brand Wy Pall L20 Kleenex Kim Towel  Kim Towel

Manufacturer: Kimberly Clark Part No. 47044 788269 KC-47044  KC-47044

88 Towels per carton 10 cartons per case Manufacturer Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

Estimated Qty = 4 cases/6 mo. Qty per case 10 18 88 twls/10 ctns/cs  10

Bag, paper, wax coated (9325) Price per case 15.23 34.80 14.95  25.70

Receptical Liner for Wall Total 91.38 208.80 89.70 NO BID 154.20

Size; 10W X 3 1/4D x 9H Size 10 x 3 1/4 x 9 12.5x5.25x10.75 10w x 3 1/2d x 9h  10x3 1/2 x 9

250 per case Product Code 6141 RCPT250 HOS-6141  HOS 6141

Product Code: HOS 6141 Manufacturer Hospeco Sannap Hospeco  Hospeco

Manufacturer: Hospeco Qty per case 250/case 250/case 250/case  250

Estimated Qty: 6 cases/6 mo.  

Paper Roll Towel Dispenser (33354) Price per case 11.18 62.33 35.00  39.60

In-Sigh Sani-Touch Total 67.08 373.98 210.00 NO BID 237.60

Product Code:  09990 Product Code 0999D  KC-09990  09990

Manufacturer: Kimberly Clark Manufacturer Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

Estimated Qty (6 per year)       

No Substitutes       

Toilet Paper Jumbo Dispenser (36301) Price Each 1.12 37.35 11.00  12.40

Coreless JRT Total 44.80 1,494.00 440.00 NO BID 496.00

Product Code: 09602 Product Code 09602  KC-09602  09602

Manufacturer: Kimberly Clark Manufacturer Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

Estimated Qty (40 in the next six mo.)       

No Substitutes

*

TOTAL - CATEGORY II Total 20,803.89 40,873.11 21,517.55 NO BID 22,572.39

Net 1% 2% 2% Net 1% 

Terms 30 days 10 days 20 days 20 days 30 days 10 days

Delivery Days    
 
 

*LOW BID   

 

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Central Poly Corp. K-Stone SAWS Website
Cleaning Ideas Matera Paper Co.
Diversifield Chemical and Supply, Inc. Mayfield Paper Co.
FARR Service & Supply Co. Safeway Supply, Inc.
Gulf Coast Paper United Services Assoc.
JanPak

W
IT

H
D

R
E

W
 B

ID

5



11-9055

F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

PROPOSAL Six month contract for Janitorial Supplies
FOR: Disinfectants, Cleaners & Paper Supplies

TIME & October 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 1, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Category I DISINFECTANTS AND CLEANERS  

 NEUTRAL ALL-PURPOSE FLOOR CLEANER Price per case 45.40 25.60 19.59 28.43

(17444) Total 544.80 307.20 235.08 341.16

Description:  Non-Dulling and rinse free, cirtrus Size 1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon

Brand:  Stride Brand Compare Johnson AS NCL Image

Size:  1 gal containers (4 per case) Product Code F2166022 JW-3904 Spec 2012126

Product Code: JW-3904 Manufacturer Franklin Johnson Johnson Diversey NCL

Manufacturer:  Johnson Qty per case 4 4 4 4

Estimated Qty:  12 cans/6 mo.

COMPLETE FLOOR FINISH (17443) Price/Envirobox 119.26 62.71 52.92 61.00

METAL INTERLOCK Total 715.56 376.26 317.52 366.00

Size:  5 gallon Envirobox Size 5 gallons 5 gallons 5 gallons 5 gallons

Product Code: 4651 Brand Megastar Extreme Complete Floor Finish AS Display

Manufacturer:  Johnson Product Code F330126 JW-5104773 Spec 201562

Estimated Qty:  6 Enviro Boxes/ 6 mo. Manufacturer Franklin Johnson Diversey Brulin

 Qty per box 5 gal. bucket 1-5 gal box 1 2/2.5 gal

FOAMING DISINFECTANT CLEANER (10479) Price per case 39.09 27.28 39.27 35.20

MISTY FOAM (12/CASE) Total 1,250.88 872.96 1,256.64 1,126.40

Product Code: APA250 Brand Misty Misty AS Misty

Manufacturer:  AMREP Product Code APA250 APA250 Spec AMR A250-20

Estimated Qty = (32 case/6 mo.) Manufacturer Amrep Amrep AMREP AMREP

ANY SUBSTITUTE MUST BE PREAPPROVED Qty per Case 12 12 12 12

CLEANER CARPET (10294) Price per case 106.25 33.45 31.73 37.81

Size:  One gallon Total 425.00 133.80 126.92 151.24

Case 4 gallons Size 1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon 1 gallon

Brand: Plus 5 Brand Spartan Plus 5 Plus 5 As Spec Husky

Product Code No: SP 3005 4 Product Code SP30054 SP3005-04 5 201898

Manufacturer:  Spartin Chemical Manufacturer Spartan Spartan Spartan Canberra

Estimated Qty:  4 cases/6 mo. Qty per case 4 4 4 4

ANY SUBSTITUTE MUST BE PREAPPROVED

DEODORANT CARPET (33352) Price per case 106.25 69.81 68.13 25.80

Size: One Gallon Total 3,187.50 2,094.30 2,043.90 774.00

Case: 4 gallons Size 32 oz. 1 gallon gallon 1 gallon

Brand: Airlift Tropical Brand Misty Secure Amlift Tropical AS BLITZIT

Product Code No.: SP3067 Product Code AMR-R930-12 SP-3067 Spec 2BZ203G

Manufacturer: Spartin Chemical Manufacturer  Spartan Spartan Safeway

Estimated Qty = 30 case/6 mo. Qty per case 12 4 gal/cs 4 4

ANY SUBSTITUTE MUST BE PREAPPROVED

LIQUID BOWL CLEANER (10471) Price per case 30.94 18.69 17.81 24.60

Description:  Non-Acid Disinfectant Total 495.04 299.04 284.96 393.60

Brand: NABC Bathroom Cleaner Size  1 qt. qt. 32 oz (Qt)

Manufacturer: Spartan SP7116 Brand  NABC Bathroom Cln. AS Bathroom Plus

Size: 1 quart (12/case) Part No.   SP-7116 Spec 201199

Est. Qty = (16 cases/6 mo) Manufacturer  Spartan Spartan NCL

Qty per case  12 qts/cs 12 12

LIQUID BOWL CLEANER (10470) Price per Case 48.95 17.16 16.37 23.18

Description:  Acid Disinfectant Total 1,272.70 446.16 425.62 602.68

Brand: M95 Mild Acid Cleaner Size  1 qt. qt. 32 oz (Qt)

Size: 1 quart (12/case) Brand  M95 Mild Acid Cln. AS Husky 300

Manufacturer: Spartan SP7115 Part No.  SP-7115 Spec 201943

Est Qty = (26 cases/6 mo) Manufacturer Spartan Spartan Canberra

 Qty per case  12 qts./cs 12 12
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

PROPOSAL Six month contract for Janitorial Supplies
FOR: Disinfectants, Cleaners & Paper Supplies

TIME & October 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 1, 2011
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CLEANER, HAND (10487) Price per case 33.15 43.24 32.75 41.25

Description: Natural Orange Smooth Total 66.30 86.48 65.50 82.50

Size: 14 oz Brand  Natural Orange AJ GoJo

Part No.: YGJ0961-12 per case Size  14 oz. Spec 14 oz.

Manufacturer: GOJO Part No.  YGJ-0961-12 GoJo961 0961-12

Est Qty = (2 cases/6 mo.) Qty per case  12/14 oz/cs 12 12

SOAP, HAND, solid (10779) Price per case 47.88 50.79 47.28 46.25

Size:  2 1/2 oz Total 47.88 50.79 47.28 46.25

Brand:  Dial Size  2.5 oz Bar AJ 2.5 oz

Part No. Dia 00197 Brand  Dial Spec Dial

Qty per case 200 per case Part No.  DIA00197 00197 DIA 00197

Est Qty = 1 case/6 mo. Qty per case  200/cs 200 200

SOAP, HAND, PINK & KLEAN (10485) Price per case 31.73 28.22 23.55 23.62

Size: 800 ML Total 126.92 112.88 94.20 94.48

Brand: GoJo Size  800 ML 800 ml 800 ml

Part No. 912812 Brand   GoJo Boardwalk KUTOL

Qty per case: 12 per case Part No.  GJ-9128-12 BWK 8100 5665

Est Qty = (4 cases/6 mo.) Qty per case  12/800 mls/cs 12 12

CLEANER, HAND WITH PUMICE (10484) Price per case 37.06 45.52 36.65 42.25

Size:  14 oz  (12 bottles per case) Total 333.54 409.68 329.85 380.25

Scent:  Orange Size  14 oz. AS 14 oz 

Brand:  GoJo Color  Orange Spec Orange

Part No. 0957-12 Brand  GoJo GoJo GoJo

Estimated Qty = 9 cases/6 mo. Part No.  EJ-0957-12 0957-12 0957-08

SOAP DISPENSER AUTOFOAM (31516) Price per each 53.95 44.40 49.48 55.40

Manufacturer:  Technical Concepts Total 53.95 44.40 49.48 55.40

Product Code: TC 750139 Brand  TC Auto Foam Disp. AS T Concepts

Estimated Qty = (1/6 mo.) Part No.  TC-75013 Spec TC 750139

No Substitutes  

Soap Autofoam Refills (31517) Price per Case 72.46 64.50 64.57 65.32

Manufacturer: Technical Concepts Total 4,927.28 4,386.00 4,390.76 4,441.76

Product Code: TC 750115 Brand  TC-Autofoam Soap TC T Concepts

4 per case Part No.  TC-750112 TC 750112 TC 750112

Estimated Qty = (68 cases/6 mo.)

No Substitutes  

Waterless Hand Cleaning (10488) Price per case 46.08 40.98 45.86 41.60

Size 4.25 oz Total 6,865.92 6,106.02 6,833.14 6,198.40

Brand Purell Size  4.25 oz 4.25 oz 4.25

Part No. 965124 Brand  Purrell AJ Purrell

Qty per case 24 bottles Part No.  EJ-9651-24 Spec 9651-24

Est. Qty (149 cases/6 mo.) Qty/case  24 btls/cs 24 24

No Substitutes  

Waterless Hand Cleaning (33154) Price/case 59.05 52.54 58.33 62.60

Size 12 oz with pump Total 118.10 105.08 116.66 125.20

Brand Purell Size  12 oz. As Spec 12 oz.

Part No. J965912 Brand  Purrell Purrell Purrell

Qty per case 12 bottles Part No.  GJ-9659-12 965912 GOJ 3659-12

Est. Qty (2 cases/6 mo.) Qty/case  12 blts./cs 12 12

Waterless Hand Cleaning Foam (33749) Price/case 61.84 55.02 59.72 55.17

Size 1200 ML Total 1,236.80 1,100.40 1,194.40 1,103.40

Brand Purell Size  1200 ml 1200 ml 1200 ml

Part No. J5392-02 Brand  Purrell As Spec Purrell

Qty per case: Two Part No.  GJ-5392-02 5392 GOJ 5392-02

Est. Qty (20 cases/6 mo.) Qty/case  2/cs 2 2
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Soap, detergent granular laundry (16034) Price per case 116.25 90.60 76.24 83.15

Size 32 oz Total 2,557.50 1,993.20 1,677.28 1,829.30

Brand: Tide Size  20 oz. 21 oz. 20 oz

Part No. PGC 30804 Brand  Tide Tide w/bleach Tide 

Manufacturer: Procter & Gamble Part No.  PGC-27782 27810 PGC 27782

Qty/case 15 ea. Manufacturer  Proctor & Gamble Proctor & Gamble Proctor & Gamble

Estimated Qty = (22 cases/6 mo.) Qty per case  15/20 oz. 15 15

Soap, Dish detergent (16035) Price per case 32.54 49.01 30.25 30.95

Size 12.6 oz Total 585.72 882.18 544.50 557.10

Brand: Ivory Szie  24 oz. 24 oz. 24 oz.

Part No. PGC0620 Brand  Ivory AS Ivory

Manufacturer: Procter & Gamble Part No.  PG-25574 Spec PGC 25574

Qty per case 10 Manufacturer  Proctor & Gamble Proctor & Gamble Proctor & Gamble

Estimated Qty = 18 cases/6 mo. Qty per case  10 bxs/cs 10 10

No Substitutes  

Cleaner, stainless steel (10495) Price per case 60.89 34.62 56.01 55.12

Size: 15 oz spray (12 per case) Total 304.45 173.10 280.05 275.60

Misty AP A141 Size  15 oz. AS 15 oz

Est. Qty (5 cases/6 mo.) Brand  Misty AP-A141 Spec Misty

ANY SUBSTITUTE MUST BE PREAPPROVED Qty per case  12/cs 12 AMR A141-20

Cleaner, Glass (10482) Price per gallon 13.75 3.31 3.24 6.99

Size 1 gallon Total 990.00 238.32 233.28 503.28

Part No. A2 9643 AKB 4 Size  1 gal. gal gal

Color: Blue Part No.  AR-9643 190 202216

Est. Qty: 72 gal/6 mo.

Bleach, Liquid (9687) Price per case 12.00 10.65 9.99 11.25

Size 96 oz 6% (6 per case) Total 336.00 298.20 279.72 315.00

Estimated Qty = 28 cases/6 mo. Size 1 gallon 96 oz. 96 oz. 96 oz.

 Qty/case 6 6/96 oz/cs 6 6

Spray Trigger (16136) Price per each 0.54 0.70 0.64 0.49

Size: 9 inch Total 51.30 66.50 60.80 46.55

Part No. T0 110504 Size 8" 9" 9" 9"

Estimated Qty = (95/6 mo.)

Spray Bottle (9829) Price per each 2.94 0.50 0.48 0.40

Size: 24 oz Size 176.40 30.00 28.80 24.00

Part No. TO 120119 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz 24 oz

Estimated Qty = (60 ea/6 mo.)  

Industrial Dusting Cloths (33741) Price per each 25.48 52.05 41.17 77.00

Size: 17x24 inches (yellow) Total 50.96 104.10 82.34 154.00

4 packs per case (50 per pk) Size 12.5 x 13 17x24 AS 17x24

Brand: Brawny Qty per case 4/50 4 pks/50/pk Spec 200 4/50

Mfg. Georgia-Pacific Brand Wypall Brawny 29616 Brawny

Estimated Qty = (2 cases/ 6 mo.) Mfg. Name Kimberley Clark Georgia-Pacific Georgia-Pacific Kimberley Clark

Heavy Duty Towel Wipes (16858) Price per each 32.86 22.90 24.22 27.50

Size: 12 1/2 x 13 inch Total 525.76 366.40 387.52 440.00

4 packs per case (50 per pk) Size 7x8 12 1/2 x 3" As Spec 12.5x13

Brand:  Wypall x 80 Wipers Qty per case 6/80 ct. 4 pks/50 ea. 200 4/50

Mfg: Kimberly-Clark Brand Lysol Wypall x 80 wipes Wypall Wuypall x 80

Estimated Qty = (16 cases/6 mo.) Mfg. Name Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark
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TIME & October 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 1, 2011
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Wipe Disinfectant Sheets (33306) Price per each 31.24 27.50 44.99 27.75   

Size: 75 per carton Total 11,246.40 9,900.00 16,196.40 9,990.00   

Qty: 6 cartons per case Size  75/ctn. 75/ctn. 75/ctn.   

Brand: Clorax Fresh Scent 15949 Qty per case  6 ctns/cs 12 6   

Mfg. Clorax Brand  Clorax Fresh Scent Wipes plus fresh Clorox Fresh Scent   

 Estimated Qty = (360 cases/6 mo.) Mfg. Name  Clorax  Progressive Clorox     

CATEGORY I:  DISINFECTANTS AND CLEANERS *

TOTAL 38,492.66 30,983.45 37,582.60 30,417.55   

Category II PAPER PRODUCTS

COVER, TOILET SEAT, 1/2 FOLD (31238) Price per case 28.19 49.04 39.90  46.25

Part No.: HG5000 Total 56.38 98.08 79.80 NO BID 92.50

Brand: Hospital Specialty Part No. HG-5000  HG-5000  891-098

Qty per case: 5000 Brand Hospital Specialty  Hospital Specialty  HS

Estimated Qty = 2 cases/6 mo. Qty per case 5000  5000  5000

TOILET PAPER (14592) Price per case 34.02 60.95 34.48  38.13

2 Ply 500 sheets per roll 4 1/2" x 3.75 IN TOTAL 4,932.90 8,837.75 4,999.60 NO BID 5,528.85

Brand:  Tork Universal Part No. 2 ply 500 sh/rl 6150 TM-1616S  TM16165

Manufacturer:  SCA Brand Tork Universal Boardwalk Tork Universal  Tork

Manufacturer Code Number:  TM1616S Manufacturer SCA Boardwalk SCA  SCA

Rolls per case:  96 Mfr. Code Number TM-16165 BWK 6150 TM-1616S  TM16163

Sheet Size:  4 1/2" x 3.75 Rolls per case 96.00 96 96  96

Sheets per roll:  500 Sheet Size 4.0" x 3.75" 4.5" x 3.75" 4.5" x 3.75"  4.5" x 3.75"

Case Weight:  37.4 lb Sheets per roll 500 500 500  500

Estimated Qty:  145 cases/6 mo. Case weight 33.07 lb 35 lbs. 37.4 lbs.  37.4 lbs.

TOILET PAPER (14591) Price per case 23.51 23.40 23.59  26.00

2 ply 1000 ft per roll 8 8/10 inch 3 1/3" wide Total 2,938.75 2,925.00 2,948.75 NO BID 3,250.00

Brand : Tork Universal Part No. 2 ply 1000/roll 3BR20306 KC-07805  TJ 0922A

Manufacturer: SCA Brand Tork Universal Sanilux Scott Jilt Jr.  Tork

Manufacturer Code Number: SC TJ0922A Manufacturer SCA Beroky Kimberley Clark  SCA

Rolls per case:  12 Mfr. Code Number TJ0922A 20306 KC-07805  SC TJ0922A

Estimated Qty = 125 cases/6 mo. Rolls per case 12 12 12  12

TOILET PAPER (36299) Price per case 35.96 66.10 36.15  40.10

Jumbo Roll Core Less Total 2,804.88 5,155.80 2,819.70 NO BID 3,127.80

3.78 inches x 1150 Part No. Jumbo Coreless 2 ply KCC 07006 KC-07006  07006

Brand:  Kimberly Clark Brand Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

Manufacturer Code Number:  KCC 07006 Mfr. Code Number 7006 KCC07006 KC-07006  07006

Rolls per case: 12 Rolls per case 12 12 12  12

Estimated Qty (78 cases/6 mo.)

No Substitutes

MULTIFOLD TOWELS (16856) Price per case 17.76 32.23 17.98  20.10

Manufacturer Code: SC MB540A Total 888.00 1,611.50 899.00 NO BID 1,005.00

Color: Bleached White Mfr. Code Number MB54A 46974 SC-MB540A  SC-MB540A

Towerl Size: 9 1/2 x 9 1/8 Color Bleach White Bleach White Bleach White  White

Towersl per pack: 250 Towels Towel Size 9 1/2 x 9 1/8 9.25 x 9.50 9 1/2 x 9 1/8  9 1/2 x 9 1/8

Packs per case: 16 packs Towels per pack 250 250 250  250

Manufacturer Name: SCA Packs per case 16 16 16  16

Estimated Qty = 50 cases/6 mo. Mfr. Name SCA Marathon SCA  SCA
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FOR: Disinfectants, Cleaners & Paper Supplies

TIME & October 1, 2011 through March 31, 2012
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 1, 2011
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Roll Towels Scott (31427) Price per case 63.62 143.60 64.00  61.30

Manufacturer Code: KC 01000 Total 8,779.56 19,816.80 8,832.00 NO BID 8,459.40

Color: White Mfr. Code Number 01000  KC-01000  KC-01000

Towel Size: 8" x 100 ft Color White  White  White

Rolls per case: 12 Towel Size 8" x 1000'  8" x 1000 ft.   8" x 1000 ft.

Manufacturer Name: Kimberly Clark Rolls per case 12  12  12

Est. Qty = 138 case/6 mo. Mfg. Name Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

No Substitutes

Towel Hand Popup (16857) Price per case 50.04 87.85 49.75  55.26

Towel Size: 9.1 in x 16.8 in Total 200.16 351.40 199.00 NO BID 221.04

Brand: Kimtowel Size 9.1" x 16.8" 9 x 10.5" 9.1" x 16.8"  9.1" x 16.8"

Product Code: KC 47044 Brand Wy Pall L20 Kleenex Kim Towel  Kim Towel

Manufacturer: Kimberly Clark Part No. 47044 788269 KC-47044  KC-47044

88 Towels per carton 10 cartons per case Manufacturer Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

Estimated Qty = 4 cases/6 mo. Qty per case 10 18 88 twls/10 ctns/cs  10

Bag, paper, wax coated (9325) Price per case 15.23 34.80 14.95  25.70

Receptical Liner for Wall Total 91.38 208.80 89.70 NO BID 154.20

Size; 10W X 3 1/4D x 9H Size 10 x 3 1/4 x 9 12.5x5.25x10.75 10w x 3 1/2d x 9h  10x3 1/2 x 9

250 per case Product Code 6141 RCPT250 HOS-6141  HOS 6141

Product Code: HOS 6141 Manufacturer Hospeco Sannap Hospeco  Hospeco

Manufacturer: Hospeco Qty per case 250/case 250/case 250/case  250

Estimated Qty: 6 cases/6 mo.  

Paper Roll Towel Dispenser (33354) Price per case 11.18 62.33 35.00  39.60

In-Sigh Sani-Touch Total 67.08 373.98 210.00 NO BID 237.60

Product Code:  09990 Product Code 0999D  KC-09990  09990

Manufacturer: Kimberly Clark Manufacturer Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

Estimated Qty (6 per year)       

No Substitutes       

Toilet Paper Jumbo Dispenser (36301) Price Each 1.12 37.35 11.00  12.40

Coreless JRT Total 44.80 1,494.00 440.00 NO BID 496.00

Product Code: 09602 Product Code 09602  KC-09602  09602

Manufacturer: Kimberly Clark Manufacturer Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark  Kimberley Clark

Estimated Qty (40 in the next six mo.)       

No Substitutes

*

TOTAL - CATEGORY II Total 20,803.89 40,873.11 21,517.55 NO BID 22,572.39

Net 1% 2% 2% Net 1% 

Terms 30 days 10 days 20 days 20 days 30 days 10 days

Delivery Days    
 
 

*LOW BID   

 

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Central Poly Corp. K-Stone SAWS Website
Cleaning Ideas Matera Paper Co.
Diversifield Chemical and Supply, Inc. Mayfield Paper Co.
FARR Service & Supply Co. Safeway Supply, Inc.
Gulf Coast Paper United Services Assoc.
JanPak
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